
Nominee Biographies 

 
Carrie L. Lutz Holton, Kansas Hospital CEO 

 
Ms. Lutz received her Bachelor of Science degree in nursing from Washburn University in 1988 and 
her Master of Science in management from Baker University in 2003. Ms. Lutz served in various 
capacities at St. Francis Health Center prior to joining Holton Community Hospital in Holton, Kansas, 
in 2012 as Chief Nursing Officer and then Chief Executive Officer under a management agreement 
with St. Francis. She then became Holton Community Hospital’s Chief Executive Officer in 2015. 
Ms. Lutz also currently serves as Past Chair of the Kansas Hospital Association Board of Directors. 

This would be Ms. Lutz’s first term as a member of the KAMMCO board. 
 
 
Jany K. Moussa, MD Wichita , Kansas Nephrology 

Dr. Moussa received his pre-medical education and his doctorate of medicine from the University of 
Aleppo School of Medicine, Mauhafaza, Allepo, Syria. He completed a research fellowship in 
osteoporosis and bone metabolism at Loma Linda University Medical Center in Loma Linda, 
California, completed his residency at the University of Kansas School of Medicine in Wichita where 
he was chief resident, and completed a fellowship in nephrology at the University of Kansas School 
of Medicine in Kansas City. Dr. Moussa is a nephrologist in Wichita, Kansas. 

This would be Dr. Moussa’s second term as a KAMMCO board member. 
 
 
LaDona M. Schmidt, MD Holton, Kansas Family Medicine 
 
Dr. Schmidt received her undergraduate degree in 1982 from Fort Hays State University and her 
doctorate of medicine from American University of the Caribbean in 1990. Since 1994, Dr. Schmidt 
has been a family medicine physician in Salina, Lawrence, and Holton, Kansas. 

Dr. Schmidt served as an elected member of the KAMMCO from 2015–2017, at which time she 
became an ex-officio KAMMCO Board member as President-Elect, President, and Past-President of 
the Kansas Medical Society. This would be Dr. Schmidt’s first full term as an elected member of the 
KAMMCO Board. 

 
Kimberly K. Williams, MD Salina, Kansas Family Medicine 
 
Dr. Williams received her Bachelor of Science in General Science from York College in York, 
Nebraska. She completed her medical degree at the University of Kansas School of Medicine, 
Wichita. Dr. Williams completed her residency at Lancaster General Hospital in Lancaster, 
Pennsylvania, where she served as chief resident. After residency, she completed a one-year 
Fellowship in Faculty Development in Lancaster. Dr. Williams joined Smoky Hill FMRP as an 
Associate Director in 2010. In October of 2018, she took on the role of Program Director. 

This would be Dr. Williams’ second term as a KAMMCO board member. 
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